
1 2 3 4 5 6 7
311.00$           321.29$           -$                 -$                 74.40$             140.47$           
180.88$           1,117.80$        $66.85/case -$                 389.01$           104.91$           

706.28$           $554.41/case -$                 397.13$           222.01$           
102.00$           587.77$           -$                 -$                 192.43$           120.41$           
134.00$           48.16$             -$                 -$                 223.75$           165.43$           
32.70$             198.13$           $439.00/case 25.92$             86.84$             57.54$             
23.80$             118.66$           $121.95/case 35.60$             54.98$             40.54$             
16.90$             99.49$             $97.13/case 29.40$             28.08$             13.65$             
20.00$             165.81$           $139.26/ase 29.16$             79.83$             52.48$             
27.00$             154.11$           $80.97/case 32.22$             77.25$             57.61$             
25.60$             282.46$           $150.91/case 38.16$             125.05$           82.33$             
80.00$             329.24$           $244.65/case 156.00$           203.71$           176.39$           
37.60$             201.05$           -$                 38.21$             95.57$             63.70$             
38.60$             224.33$           $115.37/case 41.22$             70.33$             93.96$             

155.00$           34.76$             $25.58/bottle -$                 20.53$             9.61$               
155.00$           85.22$             $24.58/bottle -$                 38.93$             9.64$               
155.00$           58.83$             $25.77/bottle -$                 20.55$             9.61$               

281.06$           $149.47/case -$                 118.45$           85.18$             
77.30$             159.48$           -$                 -$                 134.75$           257.37$           
32.80$             420.06$           $209.07/pack -$                 217.92$           166.59$           

283.80$           -$                 -$                 104.34$           76.11$             
399.90$           -$                 -$                 222.79$           198.00$           

173.00$           533.74$           $214.34/case 92.88$             204.16$           134.26$           
140.00$           309.60$           $179.26/pack -$                 250.55$           199.75$           

FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR: Laboratory Supplies

SOL NO: IFB 24 0229

DUE DATE: April 19 2024
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341-0250 (CASE OF 12)

89094-014 (CASE OF 12)

565701 (EA)

BUYER: CeeCee McGee

312-0950 (CASE OF 12)

56616-018 (CASE OF 300)

1601-16 (EA)

314-0025 (CASE OF 12)

73660-20 (CASE OF 500)

73802-15425 (PACK OF 144)

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    

0030089480 (CASE OF 100)
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1551-16 (EA)

UC475-GN (PACK OF 500)
The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.
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112-4000 (CASE OF 4)
89094-076 (CASE OF 12)

AH010-4 (CASE OF 4)
9598-34 (CASE OF 4)
14220-052 (PACK OF 200)
D1001 (CASE OF 100)
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312-2000 (CASE OF 6)
312-0500 (CASE OF 24)
PLC-09774 (CASE OF 200)
349-1000 (CASE OF 12)

039528 (PACK OF 250)
24669 (PACK OF 500)



210.00$           861.08$           $184.40/case -$                 71.95$             24.98$             
638.55$           -$                 -$                 182.82$           139.81$           

- 159.89$           -$                 12.50$             14.56$             41.02$             
348.75$           1,618.95$        -$                 -$                 493.86$           321.84$           
106.00$           424.89$           $134.14/gal -$                 117.98$           71.59$             

- 312.83$           -$                 -$                 44.62$             69.69$             
- 209.93$           $166.41/pack -$                 145.62$           108.14$           

66.20$             222.53$           64.63/1 lb bottle -$                 161.30$           45.38$             
60.75$             -$                 $66.14/bottle -$                 112.67$           52.86$             

116.25$           254.78$           $188.86/pack -$                 222.70$           161.29$           
943.00$           329.93$           -$                 -$                 203.83$           146.07$           
155.50$           301.78$           -$                 -$                 243.51$           69.58$             
153.75$           789.32$           $123.56/box -$                 240.77$           239.42$           

957.00$           $380.34/pack -$                 449.54$           395.06$           
250.50$           -$                 -$                 -$                 505.01$           345.69$           

- 810.36$           $474.80/case -$                 488.42$           58.24$             
53.10$             135.80$           $30.29/case -$                 24.06$             30.90$             

- -$                 $106.14/pack -$                 121.10$           69.87$             
- 6.64$               -$                 -$                 62.50$             19.95$             

9.40$               26.61$             -$                 -$                 24.86$             19.95$             
9.40$               26.61$             -$                 -$                 24.86$             20.79$             

- 81.76$             -$                 -$                 117.78$           19.73$             
- 91.24$             -$                 -$                 31.10$             30.47$             

119.00$           2,050.54$        -$                 -$                 778.34$           776.03$           
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DUE DATE: April 19 2024

BUYER: CeeCee McGee Th
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80099 (CASE OF 500)

28143-986 (CASE OF 200)

25384-148 (CASE OF 500)

89094-149 (PACK OF 100)

FOR: Laboratory Supplies

23005 (CASE OF 4)
1201 (EA)

19-149-863A (PACK OF 100)

56617-801 (PACK OF 6)
89097-528 (PACK OF 144)
119245000 (EA)
00295-16 (EA)
28497-244 (PACK OF 100)
D3750 (EACH)
76437-028 (PACK OF 100)

414004-288 (CASE OF 100)
NC9606164 (EA)
32889-826 (PACK OF 12)
32934-082 (PACK OF 100)

10119-041 (CASE OF 1000)

SF120E (PACK OF 200)
28137-952 (PACK OF 100)
09-735-68 (PACK OF 100)

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    

59344-055 (EACH)
63014-925 (PACK OF 50)
The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.



FOR: 
Laboratory 
Supplies

SOL NO: IFB 24 0229

DUE DATE: April 19 2024

BUYER: CeeCee McGee

17.20$             184.70$           -$                 25.44$             69.71$             46.08$             
3.50$               269.93$           $188.35/case -$                 231.74$           166.91$           

- 421.67$           $202.46/case 47.40$             155.56$           108.76$           
- 607.91$           -$                 -$                 313.35$           243.33$           

250.75$           -$                 -$                 -$                 439.30$           280.59$           
25.10$             -$                 -$                 -$                 87.15$             76.01$             
29.00$             91.22$             $25.77/bottle -$                 35.50$             28.77$             

311.00$           246.47$           -$                 -$                 82.28$             41.77$             
30.50$             100.96$           -$                 -$                 21.39$             19.54$             
41.40$             857.85$           -$                 -$                 28.52$             176.63$           

142.00$           209.63$           -$                 -$                 147.03$           107.92$           
148.00$           267.68$           -$                 -$                 125.92$           87.01$             
82.50$             138.91$           -$                 -$                 99.52$             74.57$             

- 232.20$           -$                 -$                 147.03$           103.23$           
105.00$           116.90$           -$                 -$                 80.30$             60.70$             
148.00$           255.82$           -$                 -$                 147.35$           100.84$           
267.25$           -$                 $319.18/case -$                 220.92$           183.91$           
50.50$             -$                 -$                 12.50$             62.15$             40.52$             

327.00$           82.50$             $136.00/case 16.25$             33.94$             24.05$             
- -$                 -$                 -$                 288.55$           239.16$           

192.25$           -$                 $85.50/bottle -$                 144.07$           53.34$             
- 631.42$           -$                 -$                 64.20$             52.41$             
- -$                 $44.25/bottle -$                 358.40$           217.85$           
- -$                 $32.15/pack -$                 27.70$             17.76$             
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FINANCE DEPARTMENT

BJ299-4 (CASE OF 4)
EM1.10020.0001 (EA)
34182-386 (EA)
82028-028 (CASE OF 100)
EM1.09540.0001 (EA)
14670-205 (PACK OF 500)
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05-719-56 (CASE OF 12)
21905-026 (CASE OF 17160)
EPS114-250ATOC (CASE OF 12)
2137959 (CASE OF 100)
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BDH9264-500G (EA)
IR500 (PACK OF 100)
6ASC9ST1 (PACK OF 100)
89132-876 (CASE OF 4 GALLONS)
EMSX0420-3 (EA)
S271-3 (EA)

05-403-62 (CASE OF 500)
53515-980 (CASE OF 270)
47745-138 (CASE OF 960)
05-414-006 (CASE OF 480)
47747-986 (PACK OF 200)
21-377-304 (PACK OF 500)

EM-SX0760E-1 (CASE OF 4)
CXA-9500 (PACK OF 6)
The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    



102.00$           165.23$           $134.15/pack -$                 25.52$             227.72$           
118.25$           367.26$           -$                 -$                 221.31$           237.98$           
144.25$           419.44$           $161.45/case -$                 154.29$           112.20$           
625.00$           128.77$           $319.78/case -$                 183.99$           105.76$           

- 252.68$           $120.76/case -$                 77.77$             57.48$             
300.00$           861.69$           -$                 -$                 245.17$           197.63$           

- 101.79$           -$                 -$                 194.38$           47.30$             
- 1,210.91$        -$                 -$                 332.22$           121.82$           

204.25$           274.77$           -$                 -$                 227.09$           179.63$           
15.00$             80.93$             $141.95/case 24.75$             13.39$             15.29$             
82.20$             804.64$           $68.04/case 52.61$             264.47$           171.69$           
79.10$             618.38$           $82.80/case 64.74$             265.68$           162.29$           

- 433.92$           $344.26/pack 96.00$             80.48$             60.87$             
- 276.06$           -$                 -$                 98.87$             54.55$             
- 388.61$           -$                 -$                 64.32$             47.23$             
- 152.22$           -$                 -$                 60.13$             33.69$             

30.80$             1,156.16$        -$                 -$                 251.33$           131.40$           
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BD305462 (CASE OF 400)
10058-714 (PACK OF 10)
21020-684 (CASE OF 125)
14-957-96K (CASE OF 500)
60819-854 (CASE OF 1000)
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FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR: Laboratory Supplies

SOL NO: IFB 24 0229

DUE DATE: April 19 2024

BUYER: CeeCee McGee

IRS236-0060 (CASE OF 72)
66010-484 (PACK OF 200)
89097-526 (PACK OF 144)
89097-516 (PACK OF 144)
89097-518 (PACK OF 144)
BJ365-4 (CASE OF 4)

14-177-107 (EA)
50-206-9016 (EA)
89404-394 (EA)
55058 (PACK OF 100)
33919 (PACK OF 100)
EP141-40AEP (CASE OF 72)

 
The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    
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