



PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
PROCUREMENT DIVISION

SOLICITATION NAME: TIRE EMERGENCY FIELD SERVICE, ON-SITE SERVICE, NEW AND RETREAD TIRES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 25-FSD-011

DEADLINE: 06/05/2024

PROCUREMENT OFFICER: CRYSTAL RAMIREZ

The following companies submitted bids for the above-referenced solicitation. This information is as-read from the bid opening. The Public Works Department reserves the right to verify all bids received and any award recommendation will be made based on such review.

OFFER	GROUP A	GROUP B	GROUP C	GROUP D
Best Drive Tire LLC	x	x		
MAJCO LLC	x	x		
Border Tire	x	x	x	
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	x	x	x	x
Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	x	x	x	x
Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	x	x	x	x
Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC	x	x		
Southern Tire Mart LLC	x	x	x	x

SEE ATTACHED FOR GROUP DETAILS

The City's Transparency Policy is an important component of the City's procurement process. The Policy restricts proposers from discussing matters associated with a solicitation with any City official or employee, other than the Procurement Officer designated in the solicitation, in any manner or forum other than a public meeting. Each solicitation issued by the City includes information about the Solicitation Transparency Policy, including instructions for requesting a meeting with any City official or employee through the referenced Procurement Officer.

If you have any questions about the subject solicitation, please contact the Procurement Officer listed above.

06/05/2024

GROUP A BID TABULATION

OFFER NAME	TOTAL FOR GROUP A1	TOTAL FOR GROUP A2	TOTAL FOR GROUP A3
Best Drive Tire LLC	\$255.00	\$330.00	\$135.00
MAJCO LLC	\$372.00	NO BID	\$104.00
Border Tire	\$225.00	\$297.00	\$174.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	\$583.90	NO BID	\$119.90
Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	\$305.00	\$395.00	\$200.00
Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	\$270.00	\$380.00	NO BID
Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC	NO BID	NO BID	\$150.00
Southern Tire Mart LLC	\$310.00	\$410.00	\$205.00

**GROUP C
BID TABULATION**

RETREADS - No Substitutions					
ITEM NO.	Border Tire	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	Southern Tire Mart LLC
1C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$222.00
2C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$240.00
3C	No Bid	\$182.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00
4C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00
5C	\$262.00	No Bid	222.75	\$240.75	\$0.00
6C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$250.00
7C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$280.00
8C	No Bid	\$210.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00
9C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00
10C	\$294.00	No Bid	246.77	\$281.77	\$0.00
11C	No Bid	No Bid	352.56	\$392.56	\$0.00
12C	\$462.00	No Bid	441.05	\$481.05	\$0.00

CASINGS					
ITEM NO.	Border Tire	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	Southern Tire Mart LLC
13C	\$75.00	\$70.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$85.00
14C	\$85.00	\$70.00	\$95.00	\$105.00	\$110.00
15C	\$200.00	\$100.00	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$110.00

MISCELLANEOUS REPAIRS, WITHOUT RETREAD					
ITEM NO.	Border Tire	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	Southern Tire Mart LLC
16C	No Bid	\$4.95	\$32.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
17C	\$15.00	\$4.95	\$32.00	\$24.95	\$20.00
18C	\$9.00	\$15.00	\$32.00	\$59.00	\$15.00
19C	\$14.00	\$15.00	\$32.00	\$52.00	\$155.00
20C	\$58.00	\$25.00	\$55.00	\$63.00	\$28.00
21C	\$58.00	\$25.00	\$55.00	\$65.00	\$35.00
22C	\$58.00	\$25.00	\$55.00	\$95.00	\$35.00

MISCELLANEOUS REPAIRS, WITH RETREAD					
ITEM NO.	Border Tire	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	Southern Tire Mart LLC
23C	\$17.00	\$4.95	\$8.00	\$15.00	\$11.00
24C	\$9.00	\$4.95	\$8.00	\$19.00	\$7.00
25C	\$14.00	\$15.00	\$8.00	\$28.00	\$7.00
26C	\$58.00	\$25.00	\$35.00	\$29.99	\$15.00
27C	\$58.00	\$25.00	\$35.00	\$34.89	\$25.00
28C	\$58.00	\$25.00	\$40.00	\$49.87	\$35.00

**GROUP D
 BID TABULATION**

BUY BACK CASINGS				
ITEM NO.	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	Southern Tire Mart LLC
1D	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$45.00	\$30.00
2D	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$40.00
3D	\$50.00	\$75.00	\$0.00	\$30.00

BUY BACK CASINGS				
ITEM NO.	The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company	Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc.	Purcell Tire & Rubber Company	Southern Tire Mart LLC
4D	\$30.00	\$35.00	\$25.00	\$10.00
5D	\$30.00	\$35.00	\$25.00	\$20.00
6D	No Bid	\$50.00	\$0.00	\$10.00