
1 2 3 4 5 6 7
50.98$             115.99$           111.27$           8.00$               107.00$           NB NB
10.00$             89.99$             47.28$             NB NB 79.99$             30.95$             

286.98$           329.99$           306.31$           15.00$             294.00$           NB NB
10.00$             119.99$           98.48$             NB NB 289.99$           76.95$             

266.92$           315.00$           289.13$           45.00$             278.00$           NB NB
12.00$             115.99$           107.02$           NB NB 249.99$           130.95$           
57.05$             135.99$           124.52$           10.00$             119.00$           NB NB
10.00$             69.99$             23.32$             NB NB 84.99$             63.95$             
97.43$             117.99$           104.16$           40.00$             99.00$             NB NB
45.00$             79.99$             51.28$             NB NB 104.99$           52.95$             

292.40$           327.99$           312.14$           56.00$             295.00$           NB NB
15.00$             129.99$           85.57$             NB NB 269.99$           52.95$             
34.66$             79.99$             75.02$             8.00$               NB NB NB
10.00$             49.99$             27.08$             NB NB 62.99$             26.95$             
20.90$             109.99$           113.29$           10.00$             NB NB NB
6.00$               55.99$             31.19$             NB NB 75.99$             28.95$             

140.78$           165.99$           167.68$           30.00$             145.00$           NB NB
15.00$             99.99$             123.78$           NB NB 134.99$           89.95$             

417.62$           497.90$           466.17$           60.00$             429.00$           NB NB
20.00$             139.99$           106.10$           NB NB 424.99$           149.95$           
30.57$             72.99$             94.11$             69.00$             63.00$             104.99$           81.95$             
10.00$             49.99$             74.80$             NB NB NB NB
35.27$             84.99$             84.80$             69.00$             73.00$             109.99$           92.95$             
10.00$             49.99$             70.40$             NB NB NB NB
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BUYER: Daniel Han

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    

C
o

as
t 

to
 C

o
as

t 
C

o
m

p
u

te
r 

P
ro

d
u

ct
s,

In
c

C
o

m
p

u
te

r 
D

es
ig

n
 C

en
te

r

The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.
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FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR: Printer Toner and Supplies

SOL NO: IFB-24-0303

DUE DATE: June 7, 2024 2:00 PM
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CF281X

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

3
CF237X

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

4
CF226A

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

5
CF258A

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

6
CF325X

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

7
TN760

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

8
TN770

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

9
52D1000

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

10
52D1H00

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

11
006R04383

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

12
006R04384

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 



8 9 10 11 12 13 14
105.00$           112.66$           106.42$           NB 100.00$           95.34$             92.50$             

9.00$               NB 16.61$             NB 13.00$             13.40$             42.45$             
280.00$           310.15$           298.59$           NB 277.90$           199.18$           204.90$           
25.00$             NB 47.04$             NB 30.00$             39.39$             95.24$             

263.00$           292.75$           275.96$           NB 262.30$           239.95$           233.10$           
46.00$             NB 143.94$           NB 51.00$             52.90$             194.60$           

113.00$           126.08$           120.09$           NB 112.00$           101.00$           104.64$           
12.00$             NB 37.47$             NB 15.00$             17.59$             73.96$             
95.00$             105.46$           102.06$           NB 94.50$             112.35$           87.53$             
37.00$             NB 76.09$             NB 45.00$             48.70$             95.25$             

286.00$           316.04$           302.00$           NB 283.15$           212.35$           251.37$           
80.00$             NB 121.43$           NB 104.00$           94.19$             112.56$           
73.20$             79.69$             74.70$             NB 69.90$             69.47$             75.65$             
8.00$               NB 34.83$             NB 12.50$             16.59$             39.25$             

106.00$           120.12$           109.55$           NB 105.35$           105.29$           109.82$           
11.00$             NB 36.23$             NB 15.00$             19.59$             42.85$             

141.00$           156.99$           157.54$           NB 140.75$           129.08$           149.60$           
40.00$             NB 68.50$             NB 35.00$             48.67$             105.32$           

411.00$           465.69$           467.34$           NB 417.50$           275.00$           439.00$           
40.00$             NB 85.64$             NB 58.00$             43.39$             125.22$           
65.00$             68.20$             72.44$             NB 61.75$             74.99$             65.00$             
65.00$             NB NB NB NB NB NB
75.00$             78.58$             84.66$             NB 71.15$             86.52$             74.86$             
75.00$             NB NB NB NB NB NB

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    

The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.
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FOR: Printer Toner and Supplies

DUE DATE: June 7, 2024 2:00 PM
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1
CF280A

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

2
CF281X

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

3
CF237X

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

4
CF226A

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

5
CF258A

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

6
CF325X

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

7
TN760

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

8
TN770

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

9
52D1000

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

10
52D1H00

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

11
006R04383

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

12
006R04384

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 



1 2 3 4 5 6 7
35.27$             84.99$             91.69$             69.00$             73.00$             109.99$           92.95$             
10.00$             49.99$             63.80$             NB NB NB NB
35.27$             84.99$             84.80$             60.00$             NB 109.99$           92.95$             
10.00$             49.99$             69.30$             NB 8.00$               NB NB
33.34$             70.44$             92.21$             10.00$             NB NB NB
5.00$               59.89$             22.26$             NB 10.00$             74.99$             39.95$             

37.61$             70.44$             79.50$             10.00$             NB NB NB
5.00$               59.44$             24.56$             NB 10.00$             69.99$             39.95$             

37.61$             70.44$             79.50$             10.00$             NB NB NB
5.00$               59.44$             24.56$             NB 10.00$             69.99$             39.95$             

37.61$             73.99$             87.98$             10.00$             NB NB NB
5.00$               58.99$             24.56$             NB NB 69.99$             39.95$             

61.59$             73.99$             74.20$             30.00$             NB NB NB
9.00$               58.99$             42.68$             NB NB 68.99$             47.95$             

61.59$             73.99$             83.74$             35.00$             NB NB NB
9.00$               58.99$             42.68$             NB NB 68.99$             47.95$             

61.59$             73.99$             83.74$             35.00$             NB NB NB
9.00$               NB 42.68$             NB NB 68.99$             47.95$             
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332-0410
Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

0896B001AA

21

The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.
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FOR: Printer Toner and Supplies

SOL NO: IFB-24-0303

DUE DATE: June 7, 2024 2:00 PM
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006R04386
Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

332-0407
Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

332-0408
Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

332-0409
Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 
0897B001AA

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 
0898B001AA

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 



8 9 10 11 12 13 14
75.00$             78.58$             84.66$             NB 71.15$             86.52$             74.86$             
75.00$             NB NB NB NB NB NB
75.00$             78.58$             84.66$             NB 71.15$             86.52$             74.86$             
75.00$             NB NB NB NB NB NB
68.00$             86.08$             72.56$             NB 64.35$             71.82$             6.99$               
6.00$               NB 9.28$               NB 12.00$             NB 6.47$               

66.00$             86.08$             74.25$             NB 64.35$             75.34$             9.59$               
6.00$               NB 9.28$               NB 12.00$             NB 9.06$               

66.00$             86.08$             74.25$             NB 64.35$             75.34$             9.59$               
6.00$               NB 9.28$               NB 12.00$             NB 9.06$               

66.00$             90.04$             74.25$             NB 64.35$             75.34$             9.59$               
6.00$               NB 9.28$               NB 12.00$             NB 9.06$               

63.00$             53.74$             66.93$             NB 60.70$             68.14$             51.25$             
40.00$             NB NB NB NB NB 45.96$             
63.00$             53.73$             66.93$             NB 60.70$             68.14$             51.25$             
40.00$             NB NB NB NB NB 45.96$             
63.00$             53.73$             66.93$             NB 60.70$             68.14$             51.25$             
40.00$             NB NB NB NB NB 45.96$             

  

  
  

CODE KEY:   NB = No Bid    
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0896B001AA

Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 

20

 
The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The information on the 
PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the 
PRELIMINARY tabulation.
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FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR: Printer Toner and Supplies

SOL NO: IFB-24-0303

DUE DATE: June 7, 2024 2:00 PM
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Non-OEM Equal or Equivalent 
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