(

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
PROCUREMENT DIVISION

Revised

City of Phoenix

SOLICITATION NAME: TIRE EMERGENCY FIELD SERVICE, ON-SITE SERVICE, NEW AND RETREAD TIRES
SOLICITATION NO.: IFB 25-FSD-011

DEADLINE: 06/05/2024

PROCUREMENT OFFICER: CRYSTAL RAMIREZ

The following companies submitted bids for the above-referenced solicitation. This information is as-
read from the bid opening. The Public Works Department reserves the right to verify all bids received
and any award recommendation will be made based on such review.

OFFER GROUP A GROUPB GROUPC GROUP D

Best Drive Tire LLC X X

MAJCO LLC X X

Border Tire X X X

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company X X X X
Jack's Tire & Qil Management Company Inc. X X X X
Purcell Tire & Rubber Company X X X X
Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC X X

Southern Tire Mart LLC X X X X

X

Auto Glass Clinic

SEE ATTACHED FOR GROUP DETAILS

The City's Transparency Policy is an important component of the City's procurement process. The
Policy restricts proposers from discussing matters associated with a solicitation with any City official
or employee, other than the Procurement Officer designated in the solicitation, in any manner or
forum other than a public meeting. Each solicitation issued by the City includes information about
the Solicitation Transparency Policy, including instructions for requesting a meeting with any City
official or employee through the referenced Procurement Officer.

If you have any questions about the subject solicitation, please contact the Procurement Officer
listed above.

06/05/2024



GROUP A BID TABULATION

OFFER NAME TOTAL FOR GROUP A1 TOTAL FOR GROUP A2 TOTAL FOR GROUP A3
Best Drive Tire LLC $255.00 $330.00 $135.00
MAJCO LLC $372.00 NO BID $104.00
Border Tire $225.00 $297.00 $174.00
The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company $583.90 NO BID $119.90
Jack's Tire & Oil Management Company Inc. $305.00 $395.00 $200.00
Purcell Tire & Rubber Company $270.00 $380.00 NO BID
Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC NO BID NO BID $150.00
Southern Tire Mart LLC $310.00 $410.00 $205.00
Auto Glass Clinic $570.00 $680.00 $420.00




GROUP B

BID TABULATION

PASSENGER and LIGHT TRUCK (P-Metr

IER 2 and ABOVE

tem No.

Best Drive Tire LLC

MAJCO LLC

Border Tire

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Jack's Tire & Oil

Purcell Tire & Rubber

Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC

Southern Tire Mart LLC

Company Management Company Inc. Company
8 $110.00 $73.99/A1t $93.00 NOBID NOBID NoBID NoBID S
28 $125.00 $111.92IA1t $177.10 $118.26/Alt NOBID $115.00 NoBID e
3B §125.00 $123 61/AIL $168.85 $133.00/A1t NOBID $132.33 NoBID shaeot
) $160.00 $131.56/A1L 5204.00 $137.00/A1t NOBID $137.00 NOBID san
58 $140.00 $126.70 523125 $126.70 NoBID $126.70 NO BID $181.97/A1

LIGHT TRUC

K TIRES - TIER 2 and ABOVE

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Jack's Tire & Oil

Purcell Tire & Rubber

ITEMNO. | Best Drive Tire LLC MAJCO LLC Border Tire Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
ompany Management Company Inc. Company
o s22500 sz s1es3 126000 NoBD soree7 Nomp Rz
7 S50 Siz0san szr2zs 12100 NosD sz Nomp e
o S50 S12669An s19546 sraan NoBD S0 Nomp RN
o s15000 s15002An szs580 Stasin NoBD sws10 womp RN

TRAILER TIRES -

TIER 2 and ABOVE (Unless noted)

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Jack's Tire & Oil

Purcell Tire & Rubber

memno. | BestDrive Tre LLC | MAJCOLLC Border Tire Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
Company Management Company Inc. Company
5 . 5 NGED
108 NoED s12052 510571 s12052 NoED sta052 NoBD tose
s 525000 s2r6.68 522495 5256961 NoED s266.77 08D e

MEDIUM RADIAL TRUCK TIRES - TIER 2 and ABOVE

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Jack's Tire & Oil

Purcell Tire & Rubber

ITEM NO. Best Drive Tire LLC MAJCO LLC Border Tire Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
Company Management Company Inc. Company
128 $336.00 s sar027 saon7e sa83.0¢ 538836 NosD Noso
o5 26900 ssi652 OB 936 s 25432 o8 rosD

POLICE

TIRES - No Substitutions.

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber

Jack's Tire & Oil

Purcell Tire & Rubber

ITEM NO. Best Drive Tire LLC MAJCO LLC Border Tire Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
Company Management Company Inc. Company
14B NO BID $104.25 $104.25 NO BID $106.00 NO BID NO BID $110.00
158 NO BID $110.00 NO BID $110.00 NO BID $110.00 NO BID NO BID
T NoBID o172 NosD NosD NosD NosD NosD S10675
178 NO BID $129.00 $129.00 NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID $139.00
% NoBID $135.00 No B0 $135.00 NosD 13500 NosD NosD
198 NO BID $126.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $124.54
208 NoBID $168.00 16760 NoBID $15000 NosD NosD $154.00
21B NO BID NO BID NO BID $152.00 NO BID $152.00 NO BID NO BID
2n NosD Sio79% NosD NosD NosD NosD NosD S16355
2 NosD NosD NosD NoBD NoBD NosD NosD NosD
e NoBD NoBD NosD NoBD NoBD NosD NosD NoBD
258 NoBD NoBD NosD NoBD NoBD NosD NosD NoBD
MOWER / TURF | ATV TIRES - No Subsiitfi
) ) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Jack's Tire & Ol Purcell Tire & Rubber ) )
memno. | Best Drive Tire LLC [ MAJCO LLC Border Tire pA Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
Company Management Company Inc. Company
268 NoBID $19150 NosD NosD NosD NosD NosD $19100
278 NosD $147.00 NosD NosD NosD NosD NosD $158.00
268 NoBID $14000 NosD NosD NosD NosD NosD $15200
208 NoBID 5265.00 NosD NosD NosD NosD NosD §34000




MEDIUM RADIAL TRUCK TIRES - No Substitutions

. . The G r Tire Ri r k's Tire il Purcell Tire Ri r . .
memno. | Best Drive Tire LLC | MAJCO LLC Border Tire oodyear Tire & Rubbe Jack's Tire & Oi urcell Tire & Rubber | go iy Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
ompany Management Company Inc. Company
w8 s50900 w212 2002 s sr0062 soz12 oo s
o oo sot052 oD osD osD oo oo 56500
325 oo ss2340 oo 47055 NosD ss2s40 oo s
P oo s 2245 s sr0245 o174 oo osD
. $05000 ser02 oo s s oo oo 75025
w58 oo sT081 S10%05 oo St0305 sT08 1 oo osD
w5 s P oo s s oo oo st
7o oo sa78651 o101 oo S359000 sa78651 oo s
) ) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Jack's Tire & Oi Purcell Tire & Rubber ) )
ITEM NO. Best Drive Tire LLC MAJCO LLC Border Tire A Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
Company Management Company Inc. Company
w8 NosD NosD NoBD NosD NosD wosp wosp [
w8 NosD NosD NoBD NosD NosD wosp wosp [
40B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $8,300 $10,640.00
41B NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $7,511.90 $10,252.00
) ) The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Jack's Tire & Oi Purcell Tire & Rubber ) )
ITEM NO. Best Drive Tire LLC MAJCO LLC Border Tire A Sentry Tire & Rubber LLC | Southern Tire Mart LLC
Company Management Company Inc. Company
= oo Sarora St Nosn 7 Sarora oo 70
s NosD NosD NoBD oo NosD NooD Nosb 2z
4B NOBID $12.055.22 $11,890.08 NOBID 11890.08 $12.055.22 NO BID $12,025.00
458 NOBID $13,748.66 NO BID NG BD NOBID NO BID NO BID $11,574.04
) oo Soor7s BE oD 0 Saor7s NooD S7500
W78 NOBID $1,780.01 NO BID NG BD NOBID NO BID NO BID $1,765.00
488 NOBID $3,015.32 52.976.11 NOBID 297616 $3,015.32 NO BID $3,025.00
498 NOBID $3,343.64 NO BID NG BD NOBID NO BID NO BID $3,325.00




GROUP C

BID TABULATION
[TEM NO. Border Tire The Goodyear Tire & Mar‘::gle(nsﬁ;—r::ec&orggany Purcell Tire & Southern Tire Mart

Rubber Company Inc. Rubber Company LLC
1c No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $222.00
2c No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $240.00
3c No Bid $182.16 No Bid No Bid $0.00
4c No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
5C $262.00 No Bid 222.75 $240.75 $0.00
6C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00
7c No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $280.00
8C No Bid $210.08 No Bid No Bid $0.00
9C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
10C $294.00 No Bid 246.77 $281.77 $0.00
11C No Bid No Bid 352.56 $392.56 $0.00
12C $462.00 No Bid 441.05 $481.05 $0.00

CASINGS

) Jack's Tir i ) )
{TEM NO Border Tire The Goodyear Tire & Mana ementeC&orS”an Purcell Tire & Southern Tire Mart
Rubber Company 9 Inc pany Rubber Company LLC
13C $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $75.00 $85.00
14C $85.00 $70.00 $95.00 $105.00 $110.00
15C $200.00 $100.00 $110.00 $110.00 $110.00

MISCELLANOUS REPAIRS, WITHOUT RETREAD
Jack's Tire & Oil

{TEM NO. Border Tire The Goodyear Tire & Management Company Purcell Tire & Southern Tire Mart
Rubber Company Inc. Rubber Company LLC
16C No Bid $4.95 $32.00 $15.00 $15.00
17C $15.00 $4.95 $32.00 $24.95 $20.00
18C $9.00 $15.00 $32.00 $59.00 $15.00
19C $14.00 $15.00 $32.00 $52.00 $155.00
20C $58.00 $25.00 $55.00 $63.00 $28.00
21C $58.00 $25.00 $55.00 $65.00 $35.00
22 $58.00 $25.00 $55.00 $95.00 $35.00

MISCELLANOUS REPAIRS, WITH RETREAD

) Jack's Tire & Oil ) )
) The Goodyear Tire & Purcell Tire & Southern Tire Mart
ITEM NO. Border Tire Management Company

Rubber Company Inc Rubber Company LLC

23C $17.00 $4.95 $8.00 $15.00 $11.00
24C $9.00 $4.95 $8.00 $19.00 $7.00
25C $14.00 $15.00 $8.00 $28.00 $7.00
26C $58.00 $25.00 $35.00 $29.99 $15.00
27C $58.00 $25.00 $35.00 $34.89 $25.00

28C $58.00 $25.00 $40.00 $49.87 $35.00




GROUP D
BID TABULATION

BUY BACK CASINGS

The Goodyear Tire & Jack's Tire & Oil Purcell Tire & Rubber | Southern Tire Mart
ITEM NO. Management Company
Rubber Company Inc Company LLC
1D $50.00 $50.00 $45.00 $30.00
2D $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $40.00
3D $50.00 $75.00 $0.00 $30.00
BUY BACK CASINGS
The Goodyear Tire & Jack's Tire & Oil Purcell Tire & Rubber | Southern Tire Mart
ITEM NO. Management Company
Rubber Company Inc Company LLC
4D $30.00 $35.00 $25.00 $10.00
5D $30.00 $35.00 $25.00 $20.00
6D No Bid $50.00 $0.00 $10.00
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