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City of Phoenix
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR: Fitness Equipment Maintenance and Repair

Ace Fitness Equipment Service and

Above and Beyond Fitness Repair,

O

|

a

)

S

=

o

) =

0 3 2

— c o

SOL NO: IFB 25-0484 a E »
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DUE DATE: January 1, 2025 o [t < E

BUYER: Vicente Alonzo Q 3 O = ||'|—J

1 2 3 4 5
1. Hourly Labor Rate for Repair Service (Per Hour) $ 150.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 70.00
2. Annual Preventative Maintenance Elliptical $ 6,187.50 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,875.00 | $ 1,875.00 | $ 1,125.00
3. Annual Preventative Maintenance Rower $ 6,41250 | $ 1,425.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,425.00 | $ 1,425.00
4. Annual Preventative Maintence Various Bicycles $ 6,090.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 2,100.00
5.Annual Preventative Maintenance Steppers/Climbers $ 10,920.00| $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 1,625.00 | $ 975.00
6 Annual Preventative Maintenance Treadmill $ 17,820.00| $ 2,400.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,800.00
7 Annual Preventative Maintenance Cable Crossover $ 1,776.00 NB | $ 800.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 440.00
8 Annual Preventative Maintenance Lat Pull Down Machine $ 2,062.50 NB | $ 1,000.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 550.00
9. Annual Preventative Maintenance Various Other Equipment (Each) $ 4850 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 11.00

The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid

tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The

information on the PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the
accuracy of any information on the PRELIMINARY tabulation.

CODE KEY: NB = No Bid
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City of Phoenix
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR: Fitness Equipment Maintenance and Repair
SOL NO: IFB 25-0484
DUE DATE: January 1, 2025

BUYER: Vicente Alonzo

The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The
information on the PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the
accuracy of any information on the PRELIMINARY tabulation.

CODE KEY: NB = No Bid
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City of Phoenix
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR:
SOL NO:
DUE DATE:

BUYER:

15 16 17 18 19

The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The
information on the PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the
accuracy of any information on the PRELIMINARY tabulation.

CODE KEY: NB = No Bid
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City of Phoenix
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR:
SOL NO:
DUE DATE:

BUYER:

22 23 24 25 26

The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised bid opening. The
information on the PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the
accuracy of any information on the PRELIMINARY tabulation.

CODE KEY: NB = No Bid




