
68.00$        100.00$      150.00$    $80 - $120 90.00$        139.00$    
102.00$      150.00$      225.00$    $120 - 180 150.00$      182.00$    
42.00$        100.00$      120.00$    $40 - $60 66.00$        50.00$      
63.00$        150.00$      180.00$    $60 - 90 150.00$      90.00$      
78.00$        200.00$      No Bid $150 - $200 90.00$        150.00$    

117.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00$      200.00$    
52.00$        200.00$      No Bid $80 - $100 66.00$        50.00$      
78.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00$      90.00$      

886.00$      2,950.00$   2,210.00$ 3,410.00$   3,168.00$   1,547.00$ 
1,326.50$   4,100.00$   3,075.00$ 4,910.00$   4,410.00$   1,845.00$ 

495.00$      1,395.00$   1,800.00$ 1,858.00$   4,368.00$   1,574.00$ 
125.00$      200.00$      360.00$    325.00$      150.00$      29.00$      

3,432.50$   9,545.00$   8,120.00$ 10,503.00$ 13,008.00$ 5,946.00$ 
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Labor Rate for Journeyman  (Premium Rate)

Labor Rate for Trainee/Laborer/Apprentice (Premium Rate)

Group C Emergency (Flat Rate)

Labor Rate for Trainee/Laborer/Apprentice (Regular Rate)

Group A General Services Premium Rate

Confined Space for Trainee/Laborer/Apprentice  (Regular Rate)

A
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Confined Space for Journeyman (Regular Rate)
Confined Space for Journeyman (Premium Rate)

Confined Space for Trainee/Laborer/Apprentice  (Premium Rate)

Grand Total
The city's Procurement Division will post PRELIMINARY bid tabulations within five calendar days of the advertised 
bid opening. The information on the PRELIMINARY bid tabulations will be posted as it was read during the bid 
opening. The city makes no guarantee as to the accuracy of any information on the PRELIMINARY tabulation.

BUYER: CLARA DELGADO

FINANCE DEPARTMENT

FOR: Plumbing Services including Rooter and Drain Cleaning
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SOL NO: IFB-25-0506

DUE DATE: 1/22/2025

Labor Description  (Per Hour)
Labor Rate for Journeyman  (Regular Rate)

Group A General Services Regular Rate

Group B General Services (Per Linear Ft + Core+Treatment)


