
PRELIMINARY BID TABULATION

Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y
$581,500.00 $330,200.00 $372,000.00 $310,500.00 $341,000.00 $449,500.00 $386,500.00 $465,000.00 $941,300.00
$581,500.00 $330,200.00 $372,000.00 $296,000.00 $341,000.00 $449,500.00 $440,500.00 $465,000.00 $841,500.00

No Bid $300,000.00 $409,500.00 $277,500.00 $232,500.00 $210,800.00 $339,000.00 $465,000.00 $1,600,500.00
No Bid $330,200.00 $372,000.00 $352,000.00 $372,000.00 No Bid $502,500.00 $465,000.00 $1,286,700.00

$581,500.00 $372,000.00 $372,000.00 $364,500.00 $341,000.00 $449,500.00 No Bid $465,000.00 $940,500.00
$581,500.00 $341,000.00 $372,000.00 $292,000.00 $341,000.00 $449,500.00 No Bid $465,000.00 $841,500.00

No Bid $341,000.00 $372,000.00 $277,500.00 $232,500.00 $210,800.00 No Bid $465,000.00 $1,600,500.00
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Group III Total

Group V Total

IFB No:  26-FMD-009

Due Date: April 4, 2025   

Group IV Total

Group VI Total

Group II Total

Procurement Officer:  Audrey Mims

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

Solicitation:  HVAC Maintenance, Repair, and 
Replacement Services
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Signed Bid Received
Group I Total

Page 1 of 1


